
The Dome of the Rock (Qubbah al-
Sakhrah), the centrepiece of Masjid  

Al-Aqsa, was built by Abdul Malik ibn 
Marwan between 685-691 AD. The 

octagonal building is 30m high covered 
by a dome 20m in diameter, and has 4 

entrance doors.  
 

It is believed that the Prophet  
ascended to the Heavens from the 

very rock beneath the dome.  

This is a vast underground area 
originally built to support the 

structure of Musalla Qibli. It was 
used as stables for horses during the 
Crusader occupation. During Muslim 
reign, it was used as a storage area. 
However, in 1996 it was converted 

into a musalla. 

It is also known as the Pulpit (Mimbar) 
of Burhan al-Din, the judge of 

Jerusalem. The khutbah for Eid and 
other occasions would be delivered 
from this pulpit during the summer 

months.  

Situated in the front right-corner of 
Masjid al-Aqsa, Salah al-Din al-Ayyubi 

had built this as a Musalla for the 
North Africans (Magharibah). In 1929, 
this building was converted into a 
museum that houses an extensive 
collection of historical artefacts 
related to Masjid al-Aqsa and 

Jerusalem.     

This is one of the sealed gates along 
the eastern wall of Masjid al-Aqsa and 

dates back to the Umayyad period. 
There is an ancient Musalla adjacent 
to this gate which is called Musalla 

Bab al-Rahmah which can 
accommodate 300 worshippers.  

This Musalla is situated at the front 
of Masjid al-Aqsa by the southern 

Qiblah wall. It was initiated in 705 AD 
by Abdul Malik ibn Marwan and 

completed by his son Walid in 714 AD. 
Originally, it consisted of 15 aisles but 
was later reduced to 7 aisles due to 

frequent earthquakes in the region. It 
was built directly above the musalla 

which Sayyiduna Umar  constructed 
after the conquest of Jerusalem.  

This building was known in the early 
Islamic periods as the Dome of 

Sulayman’s Throne (Qubbah Kursiyy 
Sulayman), in memory of Prophet 

Sulayman u and the time he spent in 
Masjid al-Aqsa. In later times, it took 

on the name Dar al-Hadith, and 
currently it is used for women’s 

Quran classes.  

This is the western wall of Masjid al-
Aqsa and takes its name from the 
Prophet  having tied the Buraq 

there on the Night of the Ascension. 
It is this wall of Masjid al-Aqsa that is 

referred to as the Wailing Wall.  

To the east of the Dome of the Rock, 
the Dome of the Chain (Qubbah al-

Silsilah) is an 11-sided dome structure 
that was built by Abdul Malik ibn 

Marwan. It marks the exact centre of 
Masjid al-Aqsa. 

The Dome of Ascension (Qubbah al-
Mi’raj) was built to commemorate the 
miraculous journey of the Prophet  
Masjid al-Aqsa to the Heavens. It was 

built during the Ayyubid period.  

Masjid al-Aqsa is the third holiest place in Islam and is located in Jerusalem. Masjid al-Aqsa is a 
single masjid and is everything within the outer walls in the image above. It covers an area of 

144,000 square meters. All the musallas, mihrabs, educational platforms, trees, fountains, wells, 
open areas, and so forth are equally part of Masjid al-Aqsa 


